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Over the course of the fourth century, Christianity rose from a religion actively persecuted by the authority
of the Roman empire to become the religion of state—a feat largely credited to Constantine the Great.
Constantine succeeded in propelling this minority religion to imperial status using the traditional tools of
governance, yet his proclamation of his new religious orientation was by no means unambiguous. His coins
and inscriptions, public monuments, and pronouncements sent unmistakable signals to his non-Christian
subjects that he was willing not only to accept their beliefs about the nature of the divine but also to
incorporate traditional forms of religious expression into his own self-presentation. In Constantine and the
Cities, Noel Lenski attempts to reconcile these apparent contradictions by examining the dialogic nature of
Constantine's power and how his rule was built in the space between his ambitions for the empire and his
subjects' efforts to further their own understandings of religious truth.

Focusing on cities and the texts and images produced by their citizens for and about the emperor,
Constantine and the Cities uncovers the interplay of signals between ruler and subject, mapping out the
terrain within which Constantine nudged his subjects in the direction of conversion. Reading inscriptions,
coins, legal texts, letters, orations, and histories, Lenski demonstrates how Constantine and his subjects used
the instruments of government in a struggle for authority over the religion of the empire.
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From reader reviews:

Betty Epperson:

The book Constantine and the Cities: Imperial Authority and Civic Politics (Empire and After) make one feel
enjoy for your spare time. You can use to make your capable more increase. Book can being your best friend
when you getting tension or having big problem using your subject. If you can make reading a book
Constantine and the Cities: Imperial Authority and Civic Politics (Empire and After) for being your habit,
you can get a lot more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about several or
all subjects. You could know everything if you like wide open and read a guide Constantine and the Cities:
Imperial Authority and Civic Politics (Empire and After). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science
reserve or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this publication?

Clarence Delapaz:

Typically the book Constantine and the Cities: Imperial Authority and Civic Politics (Empire and After) will
bring one to the new experience of reading a new book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique.
Should you try to find new book you just read, this book very acceptable to you. The book Constantine and
the Cities: Imperial Authority and Civic Politics (Empire and After) is much recommended to you to see.
You can also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

John Barstow:

As a college student exactly feel bored in order to reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library
or even make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's
spirit or real their leisure activity. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to at
this time there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that examining is not important, boring
and also can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important to suit
your needs. As we know that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says,
many ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Constantine and the Cities: Imperial Authority and Civic
Politics (Empire and After) can make you really feel more interested to read.

Andrew Leavens:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen need book to know the up-date information of year to help year. As we know those books
have many advantages. Beside we add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world. With the
book Constantine and the Cities: Imperial Authority and Civic Politics (Empire and After) we can have more
advantage. Don't that you be creative people? For being creative person must love to read a book. Simply
choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life with that
book Constantine and the Cities: Imperial Authority and Civic Politics (Empire and After). You can more
attractive than now.
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