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Nora is in search of something different. Bored half to death with dating suitable men and doing the right
thing, she longs for someone who can blast through the emotional deep freeze of her mundane, middle-class
life and give her the mind-blowing, anonymous sex that haunts her dreams. Someone like the men her long-
dead mother raved about in her diary. If that someone is a surprisingly erudite hunk from the wrong side of
town with a heart as big as his biceps and an astounding repertoire of sexual skill, that’s just fine. And if his
skin glows light brown in contrast to her paleness, all the better. Nate isn’t looking for anything at all. He has
big plans that will lead him out of his rough neighborhood and make his beloved grandmother proud. The
last thing he needs is someone threatening to interrupt his hard work and break down the impenetrable
barriers he’s raised to protect himself, both from the women he’s dated and the mother who abandoned him
at birth. But there’s something special about Nora. Her kindness and vulnerability sets her apart from the
usual good girl gone wild that occasionally wanders into his favorite bar, and the sexy curves beneath her
suede designer skirt don’t hurt, either. Their chance encounter quickly blossoms into a passionate night of
discovery, and as they explore each other’s bodies, they soon realize they have more in common than they
ever could have imagined. Neither is prepared for the emotional and physical intensity of their connection
and each will have to reveal tough secrets, face past hurts, and risk terrifying rejection to make it work. But
can Nora allow unruly emotion to triumph over logic? And can Nate let down his guard and trust her with his
inner pain? Or will they settle for a beautiful memory – and regret the decision forever? Note: This book
contains adult content and is not intended for readers under 18 years of age.
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From reader reviews:

Gabrielle Ponds:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of action that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a book will give you a lot of
new information. When you read a publication you will get new information since book is one of several
ways to share the information as well as their idea. Second, studying a book will make a person more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially fiction book the author will bring you to imagine the
story how the people do it anything. Third, it is possible to share your knowledge to others. When you read
this Cream & Honey, you are able to tells your family, friends along with soon about yours e-book. Your
knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a publication.

Ronnie Johnson:

The actual book Cream & Honey has a lot of information on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot
of benefit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes some research ahead of
write this book. This specific book very easy to read you can get the point easily after scanning this book.

Carlton Little:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
have been ride on and with addition details. Even you love Cream & Honey, you may enjoy both. It is
excellent combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh occur its mind
hangout people. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its identified as reading friends.

Rick Beard:

As a scholar exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the library or make
summary for some guide, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's heart and soul or real
their hobby. They just do what the educator want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing
reading critically. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful
images on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on this
age, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore this Cream & Honey can make you sense more interested to read.
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