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Legends of the Buffalo Bills, first published in 2003, is not only a story about a National Football League
team. It is also the story of the city it occupies and its fans. Original members of “The Foolish Club,” a group
of owners who bought into the idea of forming the American Football League to go up against the mighty
NFL in 1960, the Bills have had their fair share of losing seasons, but they’ve also been winners. During the
team’s ten years in the now defunct AFL, Buffalo captured three Eastern Division titles, along with two AFL
championships. Meanwhile the team strung together an unprecedented four straight Super Bowl appearances
from 1990–93.
There have been many memorable moments and characters along the way as well who are documented in
this book. Legendary running back Cookie Gilchrist and quarterback Jack Kemp led the Bills to their first
glory years, including back-to-back AFL titles in 1964-65. And who could forget O.J. Simpson, who set a
new individual rushing title with 2,003 yards in 1973? Or the Bills’ victory over the Dolphins on September
7, 1980 that ended the team’s twenty-game losing streak to Miami?

Skyhorse Publishing, as well as our Sports Publishing imprint, are proud to publish a broad range of books
for readers interested in sports—books about baseball, pro football, college football, pro and college
basketball, hockey, or soccer, we have a book about your sport or your team.

Whether you are a New York Yankees fan or hail from Red Sox nation; whether you are a die-hard Green
Bay Packers or Dallas Cowboys fan; whether you root for the Kentucky Wildcats, Louisville Cardinals,
UCLA Bruins, or Kansas Jayhawks; whether you route for the Boston Bruins, Toronto Maple Leafs,
Montreal Canadiens, or Los Angeles Kings; we have a book for you. While not every title we publish
becomes a New York Times bestseller or a national bestseller, we are committed to publishing books on
subjects that are sometimes overlooked by other publishers and to authors whose work might not otherwise
find a home.
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From reader reviews:

Eric Hough:

Reading can called imagination hangout, why? Because while you are reading a book especially book
entitled Legends of the Buffalo Bills: Marv Levy, Bruce Smith, Thurman Thomas, and Other Bills Stars your
mind will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each aspect that maybe unknown for but surely
can become your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a e-book then become one application form
conclusion and explanation which maybe you never get prior to. The Legends of the Buffalo Bills: Marv
Levy, Bruce Smith, Thurman Thomas, and Other Bills Stars giving you one more experience more than
blown away the mind but also giving you useful data for your better life with this era. So now let us
demonstrate the relaxing pattern is your body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished
studying it, like winning an activity. Do you want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Edward Orr:

Your reading sixth sense will not betray you, why because this Legends of the Buffalo Bills: Marv Levy,
Bruce Smith, Thurman Thomas, and Other Bills Stars publication written by well-known writer who really
knows well how to make book which can be understand by anyone who also read the book. Written with
good manner for you, dripping every ideas and composing skill only for eliminate your personal hunger then
you still hesitation Legends of the Buffalo Bills: Marv Levy, Bruce Smith, Thurman Thomas, and Other Bills
Stars as good book but not only by the cover but also with the content. This is one reserve that can break
don't evaluate book by its handle, so do you still needing a different sixth sense to pick that!? Oh come on
your reading through sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to listening to an additional sixth
sense.

David Blunt:

In this period of time globalization it is important to someone to get information. The information will make
a professional understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You
will see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended for your requirements is Legends of the Buffalo Bills: Marv Levy, Bruce Smith, Thurman
Thomas, and Other Bills Stars this e-book consist a lot of the information on the condition of this world now.
This specific book was represented just how can the world has grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer
use for explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some analysis when he makes this book.
That's why this book ideal all of you.

Wanda Pence:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information from your book. Book is composed or printed or outlined from each source in which filled



update of news. On this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you. From
media social just like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book?
Or just looking for the Legends of the Buffalo Bills: Marv Levy, Bruce Smith, Thurman Thomas, and Other
Bills Stars when you required it?
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