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In the first book on this tragic event, 4:09:43, Hal Higdon, a contributing editor at Runner’s World, tells the
tale of the Boston Marathon bombings. The book’s title refers to the numbers on the finish-line clock when
the first bomb exploded.

In 4:09:43, Higdon views Boston 2013 through the eyes of those running the race. You will meet George, a
runner from Athens, birthplace of the modern marathon, who at sunrise joins the eerie march of silent
runners, all aimed at their appointments in Hopkinton, where the marathon starts. You will meet Michele,
who at age 2 helped her mother hand water to runners, who first ran the marathon while a student at
Wellesley College, and who decided to run Boston again mainly because her daughter Shannon was now a
student at Boston University. You will meet Tracy, caught on Boylston Street between the two explosions,
running for her life. You will meet Heather, a Canadian, who limped into the Medical Tent with bloody
socks from blisters, soon to realize that worse things exist than losing a toenail.

In what may be a first, Hal Higdon used social media in writing 4:09:43. Sunday, not yet expecting what
might happen the next day, Higdon posted a good-luck message on his popular Facebook page. “Perfect
weather,” the author predicted. “A ‘no-excuses’ day.” Within minutes, runners in Boston responded. Neil
suggested that he was “chilling before the carb-a-thon continues.” Christy boasted from her hotel room:
“Bring it!”

Then, the explosions on Monday! Like all runners, Higdon wondered whether marathoners would ever feel
safe again. Beginning Tuesday, runners told him. They began blogging on the Internet, posting to his
Facebook page, offering links to their stories, so very similar, but also so very different. Over the next
several hours, days, and weeks, Higdon collected the tales of nearly 75 runners who were there, whose lives
forever would be shadowed by the bombs on Boylston Street.

In 4:09:43, Higdon presents these stories, condensing and integrating them into a smooth-flowing narrative
that begins with runners boarding the buses at Boston Common, continues with the wait at the Athletes’
Village in Hopkinton, and flows through eight separate towns. The story does not end until the 23,000
participants encounter the terror on Boylston Street. “These are not 75 separate stories,” says Higdon. “This
is one story told as it might have been by a single runner with 75 pairs of eyes.”

One warning about reading 4:09:43: You will cry. But you will laugh, too, because for most of those who
covered the 26 miles 385 yards from Hopkinton to Boylston Street, this was a joyous journey, albeit one that
ended in tragedy. This is a book as much about the race and the runners in the race as it is about a terrorist
attack. In future years as people look back on the Boston Marathon bombings, 4:09:43 will be the book that
everyone will need to have read.
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From reader reviews:

Corrina Sutton:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the concept 4:09:43:
Boston 2013 Through the Eyes of the Runners suitable to you? The book was written by popular writer in
this era. The actual book untitled 4:09:43: Boston 2013 Through the Eyes of the Runnersis one of several
books that everyone read now. This book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this
book you will enter the new dimensions that you ever know just before. The author explained their plan in
the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to understand the core of this e-book. This book will give
you a large amount of information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world on this
book.

Dwight Ambrose:

Playing with family in a park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you might have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. 1 activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
already been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love 4:09:43: Boston 2013 Through the Eyes
of the Runners, you are able to enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still need to miss it? What
kind of hangout type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on
its called reading friends.

Angel Sutton:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you can have it in
e-book technique, more simple and reachable. This kind of 4:09:43: Boston 2013 Through the Eyes of the
Runners can give you a lot of good friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have matter
that they don't and make you actually more like an interesting person. This specific book can be one of one
step for you to get success. This book offer you information that might be your friend doesn't learn, by
knowing more than other make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? Let's have 4:09:43: Boston
2013 Through the Eyes of the Runners.

April Miller:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our information for everything. By a book we can know
everything you want. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year ended
up being exactly added. This reserve 4:09:43: Boston 2013 Through the Eyes of the Runners was filled
concerning science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people
has diverse feel when they reading any book. If you know how big benefit from a book, you can experience
enjoy to read a reserve. In the modern era like at this point, many ways to get book you wanted.
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