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Poetry is a fascinating use of language. With almost a million words at its command it is not surprising that
these Isles have produced some of the most beautiful, moving and descriptive verse through the centuries. In
this volume we look to the East series and the wonders of India. Through the eyes and minds of its most
gifted poets to bring you a poetic guide to the charms of love. Love is a universal feeling but a few lines of
musings from a poet – assembled words perhaps softly spoken - can express a romance or desire that if we
don’t yet have we’d probably like to. And so poets have burnished their dreams throughout history and
across the globe, in every culture past and present. For most of us Indian Love Poetry tends to be the erotic
and explicit Kama Sutra and The Perfumed Garden. Or the epic adventures in rather grander volumes such as
The Epic Of Gilamesh or the Mahabararata. But this Indian Love Poetry explores an altogether softer,
gentler more soulful side. Many of the poems you will hear are by writers now forgotten or obscure but
whose words speak with a clarity and beauty that belies the fact they were written and translated, in some
cases, many centuries ago from Sanskrit and Tamil and then later Hindi, Urdu, Malayalam and Bengali. This
selection includes such famed poets as Tagore and Rumi who carefully document observed facets and flakes
of love. Men speak about their love and longing for a woman and more unusually for its time, women speak
of their love and longing for men. It’s a special and unique compilation and whilst new and different is
something we can still share and understand. Many of the poems are also available as an audiobook from our
sister company Portable Poetry. Many samples are at our youtube channel
http://www.youtube.com/user/PortablePoetry?feature=mhee The full volume can be purchased from iTunes,
Amazon and other digital stores. Among the readers are Shyama Perera and Ghizela Rowe
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From reader reviews:

Aaron Powers:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yep, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a move,
shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open as well as read a book allowed Indian Love Poetry,
By Rumi, Tagore & Others? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You already know beside you can spend
your time together with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with its opinion or
you have various other opinion?

Harley Campbell:

This Indian Love Poetry, By Rumi, Tagore & Others book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the
world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book is definitely information inside this
reserve incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get.
This Indian Love Poetry, By Rumi, Tagore & Others without we know teach the one who examining it
become critical in considering and analyzing. Don't become worry Indian Love Poetry, By Rumi, Tagore &
Others can bring if you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' become full because you can have
it in the lovely laptop even mobile phone. This Indian Love Poetry, By Rumi, Tagore & Others having good
arrangement in word and also layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Catherine Lyons:

The book with title Indian Love Poetry, By Rumi, Tagore & Others includes a lot of information that you can
understand it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This kind of book exist new knowledge the
information that exist in this publication represented the condition of the world today. That is important to
yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you inside new era of the
globalization. You can read the e-book on your own smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

Karen Delamora:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you never know the inside because don't determine book by its include may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in the
outside look likes. Maybe you answer can be Indian Love Poetry, By Rumi, Tagore & Others why because
the fantastic cover that make you consider concerning the content will not disappoint a person. The inside or
content is actually fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you
to pick up this book.
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