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The phenomenal growth of the media and entertainment industries has contributed to a fragmented approach
to intellectual property rights. Written by a range of experts in the field, this Handbook deals with
contemporary aspects of intellectual property law (IP), and examines how they relate to different facets of
media and entertainment.

A stimulating array of chapters cover topics such as: IP rights in the news, spectacles and other ephemera;
copyright and fan activities; performers' and moral rights; IP protection of television formats; publicity and
personality rights; trade marks in entertainment products; traditional knowledge, and the global digital
distribution of media content. Highlighting the need for the law to accommodate a rapidly expanding and
modernizing industry, suggestions are made for future developments.

Novel and contemporary, this Handbook will appeal to both academics and students across the field of IP,
particularly in relation to media and entertainment. Its practical focus will also appeal to both practitioners
and judges looking to work within and develop this most fascinating and topical area of the law.

Contributors include: E. Adeney, T. Aplin, G. Austin, D.S. Caudill, M. de Zwart, G. Dinwoodie, S.
Frankel, J. Ginsburg, L. Golding, J. Griffiths, M. Handler, D. Hunter, D. Mac Síthigh, M. Richardon, S.
Ricketson, M. Rimmer, D. Tan, J. Thomas, P.K. Yu, M. Williams
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From reader reviews:

Stefanie Roach:

Do you among people who can't read pleasurable if the sentence chained from the straightway, hold on guys
this kind of aren't like that. This Research Handbook on Intellectual Property in Media and Entertainment
(Research Handbooks in Intellectual Property series) book is readable by means of you who hate the perfect
word style. You will find the info here are arrange for enjoyable examining experience without leaving
possibly decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer involving Research Handbook on
Intellectual Property in Media and Entertainment (Research Handbooks in Intellectual Property series)
content conveys prospect easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different
in the articles but it just different by means of it. So , do you nonetheless thinking Research Handbook on
Intellectual Property in Media and Entertainment (Research Handbooks in Intellectual Property series) is not
loveable to be your top record reading book?

Melody Grissom:

The book untitled Research Handbook on Intellectual Property in Media and Entertainment (Research
Handbooks in Intellectual Property series) is the publication that recommended to you to study. You can see
the quality of the publication content that will be shown to a person. The language that publisher use to
explained their ideas are easily to understand. The writer was did a lot of investigation when write the book,
so the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also could possibly get
the e-book of Research Handbook on Intellectual Property in Media and Entertainment (Research
Handbooks in Intellectual Property series) from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Leigh Brown:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
lots of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , if we ask do people have spare time, we will say absolutely
without a doubt. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity have
you got when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will probably unlimited right. Then do
you ever try this one, reading books. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, often the
book you have read is actually Research Handbook on Intellectual Property in Media and Entertainment
(Research Handbooks in Intellectual Property series).

Silvia Washington:

Do you like reading a book? Confuse to looking for your selected book? Or your book seemed to be rare?
Why so many issue for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy with regard to reading. Some
people likes examining, not only science book but additionally novel and Research Handbook on Intellectual
Property in Media and Entertainment (Research Handbooks in Intellectual Property series) or even others



sources were given information for you. After you know how the good a book, you feel wish to read more
and more. Science e-book was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those ebooks are helping
them to include their knowledge. In various other case, beside science book, any other book likes Research
Handbook on Intellectual Property in Media and Entertainment (Research Handbooks in Intellectual
Property series) to make your spare time a lot more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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