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“Anyone who likes their crime fiction on the black and bloody side should move Paul Cleave straight
to the top of their must-read list” (Mark Billingham, award-winning author of the Tom Thorne crime
series).

Imagine waking up covered in blood—but it’s not your blood. There’s a nasty bump on your head, and you
can’t remember a thing about last night. The morning paper reports that two young women were brutally
murdered. You recognize their names. Pieces of the night before come back to you through the haze. And
now you’re the suspect in their grisly deaths. Welcome to Charlie’s world.

In this heart-pounding thriller, only the dead know what happened last night. On the run, Charlie suspects a
man named Cyris, but no one believes that Cyris exists. Not the police and not Charlie’s ex-wife Jo, though
she wants to trust that the man she once loved is innocent. Soon, Charlie has Jo bound and gagged in the
trunk of his car, fleeing across the countryside while the killing hour approaches yet again.

Originally published in 2007 in Cleave’s native New Zealand, The Killing Hour represents the early, “pulse-
pounding” (Publishers Weekly) work of a writer known the world over for a style that combines gruesome
thrills with clever twists and a heavy dose of devilish humor. Cleave keeps us guessing until the last page of
this fantastic psychological thriller.
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From reader reviews:

Jacqueline Kang:

With other case, little folks like to read book The Killing Hour: A Thriller. You can choose the best book if
you want reading a book. Providing we know about how is important any book The Killing Hour: A Thriller.
You can add knowledge and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, simply because
from book you can recognize everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you can be
known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, you can open a book or
even searching by internet gadget. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel uninterested to go to
the library. Let's learn.

James Stumbaugh:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be update about what going on or data even
knowledge to make these people keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe can update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming
to you is you don't know what one you should start with. This The Killing Hour: A Thriller is our
recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, since this book serves what you want and
need in this era.

Arthur Johnson:

This book untitled The Killing Hour: A Thriller to be one of several books that best seller in this year, that is
because when you read this publication you can get a lot of benefit into it. You will easily to buy this specific
book in the book retailer or you can order it by means of online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book
too. It makes you quickly to read this book, since you can read this book in your Mobile phone. So there is
no reason to you personally to past this e-book from your list.

Karen Lambert:

A lot of e-book has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, comedian, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is known as of book The
Killing Hour: A Thriller. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it could
possibly add your knowledge and make an individual happier to read. It is most crucial that, you must aware
about guide. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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