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Excerpt from Early Indiana Trials: And Sketches; Reminiscences

The writer proposes to consume a leisure hour by calling upon bis recollections of the early trials of
important cases in Indiana, which may be interesting, at least to some of our pioneer settlers who are yet
living witnesses of the truth of his reminiscences. He proposes to confine himself to the Third Judicial
Circuit of the State, and to the time when the Hon. Miles C. Egglestou was Presiding Judge of the circuit.
The Third Judicial Circuit included what was then known as the Whitewater country, and extended from the
county of Jefferson north to the State of Michigan, some two hundred miles in length, and from the Ohio line
on the east, to White River, some seventy-five miles west. The country was new, sparsely settled, and being
on the western frontier, the towns and villages were filled with Indians, trading their peltries, wild game and
moccasins ornamented with the quills of the porcupine, with the settlers, for calicoes, whisky, powder, lead,
beads, and such other articles as met their fancy. The population of the country embraced by the circuit, was
a hardy, fearless and generally honest, but more or less reckless people, such as are usually to be found
advancing upon the frontiers from more civilized life, and consequently there were more collisions among
them, more crimes, committed calling for the action of the criminal courts, than is common in older settled
and more civilized parts of the older States.

The judiciary system at the time referred to was, like the country, in its infancy. The Circuit Court was
composed of a president judge, elected by the Legislature, who presided in all the courts in the circuit, and
two associate judges, elected in each county by the people.
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From reader reviews:

Jenny Dill:

Within other case, little folks like to read book Early Indiana Trials: And Sketches; Reminiscences (Classic
Reprint). You can choose the best book if you like reading a book. As long as we know about how is
important a book Early Indiana Trials: And Sketches; Reminiscences (Classic Reprint). You can add
expertise and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book
you can realize everything! From your country until eventually foreign or abroad you may be known. About
simple issue until wonderful thing you could know that. In this era, we could open a book or maybe
searching by internet unit. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel bored to go to the library.
Let's examine.

John Enriquez:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a guide you will get new information because book is one of many ways to
share the information or maybe their idea. Second, reading through a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially fictional book the author will bring one to imagine the
story how the people do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to some others. When you read
this Early Indiana Trials: And Sketches; Reminiscences (Classic Reprint), you are able to tells your family,
friends and also soon about yours book. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a
publication.

Dennis Ross:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind ability or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book in comparison with can
satisfy your short period of time to read it because all of this time you only find reserve that need more time
to be examine. Early Indiana Trials: And Sketches; Reminiscences (Classic Reprint) can be your answer
since it can be read by you who have those short extra time problems.

Allie Littlefield:

Is it an individual who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Early Indiana Trials: And
Sketches; Reminiscences (Classic Reprint) can be the answer, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You
are consequently out of date, spending your time by reading in this new era is common not a nerd activity.
So what these guides have than the others?
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